
INDUCLE LEGALES.

*** Kerse reports this case:

THE LORDS sustained a summons raised against a party as charged to enter
heir, albeit the summons was raised within the 40 days, and that because the
summons Avas not executed until the 40 days were expired.

Kerse, MS. fol. z39-

1702. 'uly 7. BIGGAR against WALLACE.

THE LORDS sustained a general charge and summons thereon, though both
were given on the same day and at the same time; because there were 21 days

given for the first, and six for the second diet, after the out-running of the 40
days appointed for the general charge.

Fol. Dic. v. 1. p. 465. Fountainhall.

~** This case is No 125. p. 3775, voce EXECUTION.

13. November 30. SINCLAIR of Barack against SINCLAIR of Southdun.

THE LORDs advised the debate, Sinclair of Barack contra Sinclair of South-
dun. It was a competition betwixt two adjudications, both of them being for
implemen of special dispositions, wherein Barack repeated his reduction of
Southdun's adjudication as null, on this reason, that, before the forty days
tf the speci charge to enter heir were run, Southdun had raised his sum-
nns of adjidication, and executed the same within the forty days of the

ch'rge, to colpear upon twenty-one days warning, a part of which twenty-
one lays wereco-incident with the forty days of the charge, contrary to all
form ind law, ;,hich requires, that either the forty days of the special charge
be elapsed befor the summons thereon raised be executed, or else if it be exe-
cuted dtiring the turrency of these forty days, tuat it have twenty-one free days
for the fiist diet, aid six for the second, over and above the forty days, making
in all sixty-eight days confrm to the ic6th act 1540, and the 27th act 1621,
which specially requr-e the elapsing of the forty days of the charge before
executing the summons which not being obsetrvcd by Southdun, his prepos-
.erous diligence must be ieclared null. Answ.ered ior Southdun, Imo, Hs ad-
judication being all provel scripto, needed riot two Goeis, but only on.. 2do,
Though it had, yet by the continued practice aAd style now,' received, these
duplicate inducie of forty days, and tLen twenty-one anp'd six i. t e two cia-.
tions on the summons, are whaly in Jesietude; and by -nur style there is no-
thing more ordinary now than to raise thera boti at one ine, providing' t>
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